

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
FOR: Locks and Padlocks
TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 27, 2016

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	8.13	8.39	8.30	8.46	8.11	7.93	13.60						
1.	2,500 ea. (Lawson #13664) Lock, Combination, Sesamee K436, Master #175 or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.63 19,075.00	8.13 20,325.00	8.39 20,975.00	8.30 20,750.00	8.46 21,150.00	8.11 20,275.00	7.93 19,825.00	13.60 34,000.00					
2.	1,200 ea. (Lawson #13665) Lock, Corbin, Keyed #CCL 09-22-00304, CCL Security Products #906 KA 2A14852, Wilson Bohanna Co. Model #61370 or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	9.78 11,736.00	10.55 12,660.00	11.62 13,944.00	11.92 14,304.00	12.03 14,436.00	13.64 16,368.00	19.41 23,292.00	12.04 14,448.00					
3.	50 ea. (Lawson #13668) Padlock, Master Lock, #5D, Keyed Different or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.04 352.00	7.55 377.50	7.75 387.50	7.66 383.00	7.83 391.50	8.63 431.50	7.33 366.50	9.07 453.50					
4.	300 ea. (Lawson #13675) Padlock, Master Lock, #3, Keyed Alike, series 2126 or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	5.32 1,596.00	5.70 1,710.00	5.85 1,755.00	5.79 1,737.00	5.98 1,794.00	6.52 1,956.00	5.53 1,659.00	6.88 2,064.00					
5.	50 ea. (Lawson #13667) Padlock, "Master Lock" #5, Keyed Alike series 2126 size 4-pin cylinder, Master P/N 5KA or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.53 376.50	8.08 404.00	8.29 414.50	8.20 410.00	8.36 418.00	9.23 461.50	7.84 392.00	9.75 487.50					
6.	100 ea. (Lawson #13674) Padlock, "Master Lock" #3D, Keyed to #SM739 or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.24 724.00	7.66 766.00	7.86 786.00	7.78 778.00	7.94 794.00	8.76 876.00	7.43 743.00	9.26 926.00					
7.	100 ea. (Lawson #13673) Padlock, "Master Lock" #7, Keyed to P609 or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.33 433.00	4.64 464.00	4.76 476.00	4.71 471.00	4.92 492.00	5.30 530.00	4.50 450.00	5.61 561.00					
	TOTAL	TOTAL	34,292.50	36,706.50	38,738.00	38,833.00	39,475.50	40,898.00	46,727.50	52,940.00					
	EXTENSION 1 - JUNE 1, 2017 - MAY 31, 2018														
1.	2,500 ea. (Lawson #13664) Lock, Combination, Sesamee K436, Master #175 or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.63 19,075.00	8.13 20,325.00	8.39 20,975.00	8.30 20,750.00	8.46 21,150.00	8.11 20,275.00	7.93 19,825.00	13.60 34,000.00					
2.	1,200 ea. (Lawson #13665) Lock, Corbin, Keyed #CCL 09-22-00304, CCL Security Products #906 KA 2A14852, Wilson Bohanna Co. Model #61370 or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	9.78 11,736.00	10.55 12,660.00	11.62 13,944.00	11.92 14,304.00	12.39 14,868.00	14.32 17,184.00	20.01 24,012.00	12.04 14,448.00					
3.	50 ea. (Lawson #13668) Padlock, Master Lock, #5D, Keyed Different or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.04 352.00	7.93 396.50	7.75 387.50	7.66 383.00	7.83 391.50	8.63 431.50	7.33 366.50	9.07 453.50					
4.	300 ea. (Lawson #13675) Padlock, Master Lock, #3, Keyed Alike, series 2126 or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	5.32 1,596.00	5.99 1,797.00	5.85 1,755.00	5.79 1,737.00	5.98 1,794.00	6.52 1,956.00	5.53 1,659.00	6.88 2,064.00					
5.	50 ea. (Lawson #13667) Padlock, "Master Lock" #5, Keyed Alike series 2126 size 4-pin cylinder, Master P/N 5KA or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.53 376.50	8.48 424.00	8.29 414.50	8.20 410.00	8.36 418.00	9.23 461.50	7.84 392.00	9.75 487.50					
6.	100 ea. (Lawson #13674) Padlock, "Master Lock" #3D, Keyed to #SM739 or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.24 724.00	8.04 804.00	7.86 786.00	7.78 778.00	7.94 794.00	8.76 876.00	7.43 743.00	9.26 926.00					

Independent Hardware, Inc.
14 South Front Street
Philadelphia, PA 19106

Craftmaster Hardware, LLC
190 Vereen Drive
Northvale, NJ 07647

Royall Mathiesen
446 Calabra
San Antonio, TX 78201

Safety Supply, Inc.
11827 Tech Com Rd #114
San Antonio, TX 78233

San Antonio Lighthouse
for the Blind
2305 Roosevelt Ave.
San Antonio, TX 78210

Bullchase, Inc.
201 S. Lakehine Blvd, Suite 503
Cedar Park, TX 78613

Clark Security Products
A Division of Amstar, Inc.
1601 Waters Ridge Rd.
Lewisville, TX 75057

Wesco Distribution
4410 Dividend
San Antonio, TX 78263

Acme Safe & Lock Co.
138 Kenney Place
San Antonio, TX 78232

Alamo Distribution, LLC
943 AT&T Center Pkwy
San Antonio, TX 78219

Herbert L. Flake Co., LLC
5235 Glenmont Dr.
Houston, TX 77081

MSC Industrial Supply
121 Interpark Blvd., Ste. 1203
San Antonio, TX 78216

Baytech Supply

Accredited Lock Supply Co.
1161 Paterson Plank Rd.
Secaucus, NJ 07094

Baker's Safe Lock Co.
5612 Fondren
Houston, TX 77056

BID NOT TABULATED
NON-RESPONSIVE

BID NOT TABULATED
DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM

BID NOT TABULATED
DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM

NO BID

BID NOT TABULATED
NON-RESPONSIVE

NO BID

BID NOT TABULATED
NON-RESPONSIVE
NOT AN APPROVED EQUAL

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
FOR: Locks and Padlocks
TIME & DATE: (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017)
3:00 p.m., April 27, 2016

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY																	
7.	100 ea. (Lawson #13673) Padlock, "Master Lock" #7, Keyed to P609 or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.33 433.00	4.87 487.00	4.76 476.00	4.71 471.00	4.92 492.00	5.30 530.00	4.50 450.00	5.61 561.00								
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	7KA P609	Master 7KA P609	Master Lock 7KA P609	Master Lock 7KA P609	Master Lock 7	Master Lock 7KAKNP609	Master 7KAP609	Master Lock 7								
	EXTENSION 1 TOTAL	TOTAL	34,292.50	36,893.50	38,738.00	38,833.00	39,907.50	41,714.00	47,447.50	52,940.00								
1.	EXTENSION 2 - JUNE 1, 2018 - MAY 31, 2019 2,500 ea. (Lawson #13664) Lock, Combination, Sesamee K436, Master #175 or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.94 19,850.00	10.55 26,375.00	8.65 21,625.00	8.30 20,750.00	8.46 21,150.00	8.52 21,300.00	8.35 20,875.00									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Master 175	Master 175	Master 175	Masterlock 175	Masterlock 175	Masterlock 175	Masterlock 175									
2.	1,200 ea. (Lawson #13665) Lock, Corbin, Keyed #CCL 09-22-00304, CCL Security Products #906 KA 2A14852, Wilson Bohanna Co. Model #61370 or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	9.78 11,736.00	11.08 13,296.00	11.97 14,364.00	11.92 14,304.00	12.76 15,312.00	15.04 18,048.00	20.43 24,516.00									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Wilson Bohannan 61370 KA 2A14852	CCL 906 KA-2A14852	Wilson Bohannan 61370	Wilson Bohannan 61370-1	Wilson Bohannan 61370	Wilson Bohannan 61370	CCL 906KA2A14852									
3.	50 ea. (Lawson #13668) Padlock, Master Lock, #5D, Keyed Different or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.32 366.00	8.33 416.50	7.99 399.50	7.66 383.00	7.83 391.50	9.06 453.00	7.71 385.50									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Master 5-Keved Different	Master 5	Master 5	Master 5	Master Lock 5D	Master Lock 5	Master 5D									
4.	300 ea. (Lawson #13675) Padlock, Master Lock, #3, Keyed Alike, series 2126 or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	5.53 1,659.00	6.29 1,887.00	6.04 1,812.00	5.79 1,737.00	5.98 1,794.00	6.85 2,055.00	5.82 1,746.00									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Master 3 KA 2126	Master 3KA 2126	Master 3KA 2126	Master Lock 3KA 2126	Master Lock 3	Master Lock 3KAKN2126	Master 3 KA2126									
5.	50 ea. (Lawson #13667) Padlock, "Master Lock" #5, Keyed Alike series 2126 size 4-pin cylinder, Master P/N 5KA or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.83 391.50	8.90 445.00	8.54 427.00	8.20 410.00	8.36 418.00	9.69 484.50	8.25 412.50									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Master 5 KA 2126	Master 5KA 2126	Master 5KA 2126	Master Lock 5KA 2126	Master Lock 5	Master Lock 5KAKN2126	Master KA2126									
6.	100 ea. (Lawson #13674) Padlock, "Master Lock" #3D, Keyed to #SM739 or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.53 753.00	8.44 844.00	8.09 809.00	7.78 778.00	7.94 794.00	9.20 920.00	7.83 783.00									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Master 3 MK SM739	Master 3MK SM739	Master 3MK SM39	Masterlock 3MK SM739	Master Lock 3D	Master Lock 3MK	Master 3MK SM739									
7.	100 ea. (Lawson #13673) Padlock, "Master Lock" #7, Keyed to P609 or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.49 449.00	5.11 511.00	4.91 491.00	4.71 471.00	4.92 492.00	5.57 557.00	4.74 474.00									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Master 7 KA P609	Master 7KA P609	Master 7KA P609	Master Lock 7KA P609	Master Lock 7	Master Lock 7KAK609	Master Lock 7KAKP609									
	EXTENSION 2 TOTAL	TOTAL	35,204.50	43,774.50	39,927.50	38,833.00	40,351.50	43,817.50	49,192.00									
1.	EXTENSION 3 - JUNE 1, 2019 - MAY 31, 2020 2,500 ea. (Lawson #13664) Lock, Combination, Sesamee K436, Master #175 or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.94 19,850.00	11.08 27,700.00	8.81 22,025.00	8.30 20,750.00	8.46 21,150.00	8.95 22,375.00	8.35 20,875.00									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Master 175	Master 175	Master 175	Masterlock 175	Masterlock 175	Masterlock 175	Master 175									
2.	1,200 ea. (Lawson #13665) Lock, Corbin, Keyed #CCL 09-22-00304, CCL Security Products #906 KA 2A14852, Wilson Bohanna Co. Model #61370 or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	9.78 11,736.00	11.63 13,956.00	12.21 14,652.00	11.92 14,304.00	13.15 15,780.00	15.79 18,948.00	20.43 24,516.00									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Wilson Bohannan 61370 KA 2A14852	CCL 906 KA-2A14852	Wilson Bohannan 61370	Wilson Bohannan 61370-1	Wilson Bohannan 61370	Wilson Bohannan Co. 61370	CCL 906KA2A14852									
3.	50 ea. (Lawson #13668) Padlock, Master Lock, #5D, Keyed Different or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.32 366.00	8.66 433.00	8.14 407.00	7.66 383.00	7.83 391.50	9.51 475.50	7.71 385.50									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Master 5-Keved Different	Master 5	Master 5	Master 5	Master Lock 5D	Master Lock 5	Master 5D									
4.	300 ea. (Lawson #13675) Padlock, Master Lock, #3, Keyed Alike, series 2126 or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	5.53 1,659.00	6.54 1,962.00	6.15 1,845.00	5.79 1,737.00	5.98 1,794.00	7.19 2,157.00	5.82 1,746.00									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Master 3 KA 2126	Master 3KA 2126	Master 3KA 2126	Master Lock 3KA 2126	Master Lock 3	Master Lock 3KAKN2126	Master Lock 3KAK2126									
5.	50 ea. (Lawson #13667) Padlock, Master Lock #5, Keyed Alike series 2126 size 4-pin cylinder, Master P/N 5KA or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	7.83 391.50	9.26 463.00	8.72 436.00	8.20 410.00	8.36 418.00	10.17 508.50	8.25 412.50									
	Manufacturer/Model	MFG/MODEL	Master 5 KA 2126	Master 5KA 2126	Master 5KA 2126	Master Lock 5KA 2126	Master Lock 5	Master Lock 5KAKN2126	Master Lock 5KAK2126									

BID NOT TABULATED
NON-RESPONSIVE

BID NOT TABULATED
DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM

BID NOT TABULATED
DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM

NO BID

BID NOT TABULATED
DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM

NO BID

BID NOT TABULATED
NON-RESPONSIVE
NOT AN APPROVED EQUAL

NO BID

Acme Safe & Lock Co.
138 Kenney Place
San Antonio, TX 78232

Alamo Distribution, LLC
943 AT&T Center Pkwy
San Antonio, TX 78219

Herbert L. Flake Co., LLC
5235 Glenmont Dr.
Houston, TX 77081

Pimlico Key

MSC Industrial Supply
121 Interpark Blvd., Ste. 1203
San Antonio, TX 78216

Baytech Supply

Accredited Lock Supply Co.
1161 Paterson Plank Rd.
Secaucus, NJ 07094

Baker's Safe Lock Co.
5612 Fondren
Houston, TX 77056

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Locks and Padlocks
 TIME & DATE: (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017)
 3:00 p.m., April 27, 2016

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Independent Hardware, Inc. 14 South Front Street Philadelphia, PA 19106	Craftmaster Hardware, LLC 190 Vereens Drive Northvale, NJ 07647	Royall Matthiessen 446 Colaba San Antonio, TX 78201	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Rd. #114 San Antonio, TX 78233	San Antonio Lighthouse for the Blind 2305 Roosevelt Ave. San Antonio, TX 78210	Bullchase, Inc. 201 S. Lakeline Blvd, Suite 503 Cedar Park, TX 78613	Clark Security Products A Division of Amstar, Inc. 1601 Waters Ridge Rd. Lewisville, TX 75057	Wesco Distribution 4410 Dividend San Antonio, TX 78263	Acme Safe & Lock Co. 138 Kenley Place San Antonio, TX 78232	Alamo Distribution, LLC 943 AT&T Center Pkwy San Antonio, TX 78219	Herbert L. Flake Co., LLC 5235 Glenmont Dr. Houston, TX 77081	Pimlico Key	MSC Industrial Supply 121 Interpark Blvd., Ste. 1203 San Antonio, TX 78216	Baytech Supply	Accredited Lock Supply Co. 1161 Paterson Plank Rd. Secaucus, NJ 07094	Baker's Safe Lock Co. 5612 Fondren Houston, TX 77056
6.	100 ea. (Lawson #13674) Padlock, "Master Lock" #3D, Keyed to #SM739 or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	7.53 753.00 Master 3 MK SM739	8.78 878.00 Master 3MK SM739	8.27 827.00 Master 3MK SM39	7.78 778.00 Masterlock 3MK SM739	7.94 794.00 Master Lock 3D	9.66 966.00 Master Lock MK	7.83 783.00 Master 3 MKSM739									
7.	100 ea. (Lawson #13673) Padlock, "Master Lock" #7, Keyed to P609 or approved equal Manufacturer/Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	4.49 449.00 Master 7 KA P609	5.31 531.00 Master 7KA P609	5.01 501.00 Master 7KA P609	4.71 471.00 Master Lock 7KA P609	4.92 492.00 Master Lock 7	5.85 585.00 Master Lock 7KAKNP609	4.74 474.00 Master Lock 7KAP609									
EXTENSION 3 TOTAL		TOTAL	35,204.50	45,923.00	40,693.00	38,833.00	40,819.50	46,015.00	49,192.00									
Terms			Net 30 days	Net 30 days	2% 10 days	2% 10 days	2% 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days									
Delivery Days			10-15 days	30 days	3 days	1-2 days	5 days	3-25 days	1-5 days									

***LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

ACC Lock
 Access Key Service
 Accredited Lock Supply Co.
 Acme Safe & Lock
 Addax Lock Smith
 Alamo Distribution LLC
 Allied Locks
 Baytin Corp
 Bullchase Inc.
 Champion Lock
 Clark Security Products
 CM Locksmith
 Craftmaster Hardware LLC
 Grainger

Herbert L Flake Co. LLC
 Independent Hardware Inc.
 J Ross Bolts Safe
 Lone Star Int'l
 Mapa Distributors
 Meister Supply
 MSC Industrial Supply
 PDME
 Pimlico Key
 Quality Security
 Royall Matthiessen
 SA Lighthouse for the Blind
 Safety Supply Inc.
 Sunbel Mill

The Ultimate Lock
 Unitore Direct
 Wesco Distribution

 Demandstar
 Lawson Website